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LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL
SEPTEMBER 22, 2009
UNANIMOUS AGENDA

PROPOSED ORDINANCE

1.

PROPOSED ORDINANCE requiring the Parish President to give a monthly
Administrative report. (M. MATHERNE)

RESOLUTIONS:

2.

RESOLUTION requesting the Louisiana Department of Transportation and
Development (LADOTD) to remove the “No Parking” sign in front of the medical
office of Dr. Timothy Maines and Dr. Karl Gerald Haydel, 3916 Hwy 1, Raceland,
Louisiana, Ward (3), District (5), Parish of Lafourche, State of Louisiana. (M. MATHERNE)

RESOLUTION to submitan appeal of the Lafourche Parish Digital Flood Insurance
Rate Maps provided to the Parish on July 30, 2008 and authorizing the Parish

President to sign, execute and administer any and all relevant documents.
(R. DOUCET FOR ADMINISTRATION)

RESOLUTION accepting the low bid for Roadway Improvements in Road Sales Tax
District No. 2, Phase 4G (East 51*t and East 52" Street Drainage) in the amount of
$253,429.00 from Byron E. Talbot Contractor, Inc. and authorizing the Parish

President to sign, execute and administer said contract and associated documents.
(R. DOUCET FOR ADMINISTRATION)
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I'TEM 1

The following ordinance was submitted for introduction by , inregular session
convened on

PROPOSED ORDINANCE

The following Ordinance, having been previously introduced and published, was offered for final
adoption by seconded by :

ORDINANCE NO.

ORDINANCE REQUIRING THE PARISHPRESIDENT TOGIVEAMONTHLY
ADMINISTRATIVE REPORT.

BE IT ORDAINED, by the Lafourche Parish Council convened in regular session on
, that:

SECTION 1. This Ordinance does hereby establish that the Parish President give a monthly
Administrative report.

SECTION 2. If any section, clause, paragraph, provision or portion of these regulations shall
be held invalid by any court of competent jurisdiction, such holding shall not affect any other section,
clause, paragraph, provision or portion of these regulations.

SECTION 3. All Ordinances or parts of Ordinances by the Lafourche Parish Council
conflicting with or inconsistent with the provisions of these regulations are hereby repealed.

SECTION 4. This Ordinance shall be published in the Office Journal of the Lafourche Parish
Council in the manner provided by law.

SECTIONDS. This Ordinance, having been submitted in writing, having been read and adopted
by sections at a public meeting of said Council, was then submitted to an official vote as a whole, the
vote thereon being as follows:

YEAS:

NAYS:

ABSENT:

SECTION 6. This Ordinance shall become effective on the tenth day after final publication.
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I'TEM 1

JERRY JONES, CHAIRMAN
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL

CARLEEN B. BABIN, COUNCIL CLERK
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL

El S e i i e e b
Delivered to the Parish President on

, at .m.

APPROVED:

UNAPPROVED:

VETOED:

Lafourche Parish President
Returned to the Council Clerk on

, at .m.

R i S b S b

I, CARLEEN B. BABIN, Council Clerk for the Lafourche Parish Council, do hereby certify that the
foregoing is a true and correct copy of Ordinance No. , enacted by the Assembled Council in
Regular Session on , 2009, at which meeting a quorum was present, and was
finally adopted on . 2009.

GIVEN UNDER MY OFFICIAL SIGNATURE AND SEAL OF OFFICE THIS DAY OF
, 2009.

CARLEEN B. BABIN, COUNCIL CLERK
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL

DATE PUBLISHED:

DATE EFFECTIVE:
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On motion by , and seconded by , the following
resolution was introduced and adopted:

RESOLUTION NO.

RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE LOUISIANA DEPARTMENT OF
TRANSPORTATION AND DEVELOPMENT (LADOTD) TO REMOVE THE
“NO PARKING” SIGN IN FRONT OF THE MEDICAL OFFICE OF DR.
TIMOTHY MAINES AND DR. KARL GERALD HAYDEL, 3916 HWY. 1,
RACELAND, LOUISIANA, WARD (3), DISTRICT (5), PARISH OF
LAFOURCHE, STATE OF LOUISIANA.

WHEREAS, the Lafourche Parish Council has made and continues to make requests to the
Louisiana Department of Transportation and Development which concerns the general health, safety and
welfare of the citizens of the Parish; and

WHEREAS, removal of this sign is being requested because it is preventing patients from
parking on Hwy. 1 as allowed by other businesses; therefore,

BE IT RESOLVED, by the Lafourche Parish Council convened in regular session on
, that it does hereby request the Louisiana Department of Transportation and
Development (LADOTD) to remove the “No Parking” sign in front of the medical office of Dr. Timothy
Maines and Dr. Karl Gerald Haydel, 3916 Hwy. 1, Raceland, Louisiana, Ward (3), District (5), Parish
of Lafourche, State of Louisana.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that a certified copy of this resolution be forwarded to the
Louisiana Department of Transportation and Development, Attn: Mr. Michael Stack, District
Administrator, Post Office Box 9180, Bridge City, Louisiana 70096-9180; and the Office of the Parish
Administrator.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote, the vote thereon was as follows:

YEAS:

NAYS:

ABSENT:

And the resolution was declared adopted this , day of
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I'TEM 2

JERRY JONES, CHAIRMAN
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL

CARLEEN B. BABIN, COUNCIL CLERK
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL

ECE I I

I, CARLEEN B. BABIN, Council Clerk for the Lafourche Parish Council, do hereby certify that the

foregoing is a true and correct copy of Resolution No , adopted by the Assembled Council in
Regular Session on , at which meeting a quorum was present.
GIVEN UNDER MY OFFICIAL SIGNATURE AND SEAL OF OFFICE THIS DAY OF

CARLEEN B. BABIN, COUNCIL CLERK
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL
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BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that a certified copy of this Resolution shall be
forwarded to; Picciola & Associates, Inc.; Byron E. Talbot Contractor, Inc.; Lafourche
Parish Government Department of Public Works; Finance Department, and the Office of
the Parish Administrator.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote, the vote thereon was as follows:

YEAS:

NAYS:

ABSENT:

And the resolution was declared adopted this day of

JERRY JONES, CHAIRMAN
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL

CARLEEN B. BABIN, COUNCIL CLERK
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL

R i S i

I, CARLEEN B. BABIN, Council Clerk for the Lafourche Parish Council, do hereby
certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of Resolution No.

adopted by the Assembled Council in Regular Session on
, at which meeting a quorum was present.

GIVEN UNDER MY OFFICIAL SIGNATURE AND SEAL OF OFFICE THIS ,
DAY OF , 2009.

CARLEEN B. BABIN, COUNCIL CLERK
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL






lrll‘ II Dl él BID TABULATION

PROJECT NAME: Roadway and Drainage Improvements
In Road Sales Tax District No. 2 - Phase 4G
East 51st and East 52nd Street Drainage
OWNER: Lafourche Parish Government
ENGINEER: Picciola & Associates, Inc.
DATE: September 16,2009 10:00 A.M.

STATE
CONTRACTOR LICENSE NO. TOTAL BID
1 |Byron E. Talbot Contractor, Inc. 12198 $253,429.00
2 {Phylway Construction, L.L.C. 27634 $322,020.50
3 |Civil Construction Contractors, L.L.C. 18794 $328,178.25
4 {G&W Construction Co., Inc. 10830 $353,968.75
5 |LA Contracting Enterprise, L.L..C. 34263 $354,967.50
6 |Stranco, Inc. 16724 $410,700.00
7 |Picciola Construction Co., Inc. 34639 NO BID
8 |Thigpen Construction Co., Inc. 4435 NO BID
9 |Fenton Excavating & Construction, Inc. 50078 NO BID
10 {Sealevel Construction, Inc. 33678 NO BID
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CONTRACT: Lafourche Parish Government Engineer: Picciola & Associates, Inc.
Roadway and Drainage Improvements Bid Date: September 16, 2009
In Road Sales Tax District No. 2 - Phase 4G
East 51st and East 52nd Street Drainage
Bidder No. 1 Bidder No. 2 Bidder No. 3
Byron E. Talbot Contractor, Inc. Phylway Construction, L.L.C. Civil Construction Contractors, L.L.C.
BASE BID LA Cont. Lisc. No. 12198 LA Cont. Lisc. No. 27634 LA Cont. Lisc. No. 18794
Item No. Pay Item Quantity Unit Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount
202-02-D |Removal of Concrete Walks and Drives 1,216 Square Yard | $ 6501 % 7,904.00 1 $ 8351 $ 10,153.60 1 $ 18.00 | $ 21,888.00
202-02-1 |Removal of Existing Culverts 4,784 Linear Foot $ 1501 % 7,176.00 1 $ 2851 % 13,634.40 | $ 4501 $ 21,528.00
202-02-J |Removal of Existing Catch Basins 60 Each $ 75.001 % 4,500.00 1 $ 85.00 $ 5,100.00 | $ 4100 ] $ 2,460.00
202-02-K  [Removal of Asphalt Drives 88 Square Yard | $ 6501 $ 572001 $ 9.00{ $ 79200 $ 22751 $ 2,002.00
401-03 Aggregate Surface Course (6") 160 Ton $ 53751 % 8,600.00 | $ 550018 8,800.00 | $ 4350 | $ 6,960.00
501-01-A  |Asphaltic Concrete (Paved Drives and Turnouts) 86 Ton $ 175.00 { $ 15,050.00 | $ 26500 | $ 22,790.00 | $ 182.00 | $ 15,652.00
701-06-A  |Side Drain Pipe Arch (17"x13" BCCSPA) 834 Linear Foot | $ 23.001 $ 19,182.00 | $ 34001 $ 28,356.00 | $§ 2775 $ 23,143.50
701-06-B  [Side Drain Pipe Arch (21"x15" BCCSPA) 701 Linear Foot | $ 26501 $ 18,576.50 | § 4050 1 $ 28,390.50 | $ 3125 | § 21,906.25
701-06-D  |Side Drain Pipe Arch (28"x20" BCCSPA) 886 Linear Foot | $§ 32751 % 29,016.50 | $ 42751 $ 37,876.50 | $ 3775 | $ 33,446.50
702-03-A  |Catch Basin (CB-01) 18 Each $ 1,500.00 | $ 27,000.00 | $ 1,650.00 | $ 29,700.00 | $ 1,657.00 | $ 29,826.00
706-02-C  {Concrete Drive (6" Thick) 1,216 Square Yard | $ 42.00 | $ 51,072.00 | $ 49.00 | $ 59,584.00 | $ 60.50 | $ 73,568.00
713-01 Temporary Signs and Batricades 1 Lump Sum $ 1,700.00 | $ 1,700.00 1 $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 2,360.00 | $ 2,360.00
715-01 Topsoil 200 Cubic Yard | $ 12501 $ 2,500.00 | $ 13.00| $ 2,600.00 | $ 1820 | $ 3,640.00
723-02 Granular Material (Vehicular Measurement) 600 Cubic Yard $ 18751 $ 11,250.00 | $ 17.00 $ 10,200.00 | $ 16.00 | § 9,600.00
726-01 Bedding Material (Limestone or Recycled Portland Cement Concrete) 36 Ton $ 3750 | $ 1,350.00 | $ 3750 | §$ 1,350.00 | $ 43,00 | $ 1,548.00
727-01 Mobilization 1 Lump Sum $ 9,200.00 | $ 9,200.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 11,370.00 | $ 11,370.00
740-01 Construction Layout 1 Lump Sum $ 3,50000 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,370.00 | $ 5,370.00
S-001 Saw Cut Concrete Walks and Drives 2,114 Linear Foot $ 6.00]$ 12,684.00 | $ 9.00] % 19,026.00 | $ 9.001 $ 19,026.00
S-002 Saw Cut Asphalt Walks and Drives 106 Linear Foot | § 6001 $ 636.00 | $ 400 $ 42400 | $ 8.00|$ 848.00
S-003 Saw Cut Asphalt Roadway 38 Linear Foot | $ 6001 $ 228.00 | $ 6.00 1 $ 228.00 | $ 8.00|$ 304.00
S-004 Sweep Existing Ditches 5,433 Linear Foot | $ 400 $ 21,732.00 | $ 350 | $ 19,01550 | $ 400 $ 21,732.00
BASE BID TOTAL § 253,429.00 $ 322,020.50 $ 328,178.25
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CONTRACT: Lafourche Parish Government Engineer: Picciola & Associates, Inc.
Roadway and Drainage Improvements Bid Date: September 16, 2009
In Road Sales Tax District No. 2 - Phase 4G
East 51st and East 52nd Street Drainage
Bidder No. 4 Bidder No. 5 Bidder No. 6
G & W Construction Co., Inc. LA Contracting Enterprise, L.L.C. Stranco, Inc.
BASE BID LA Cont. Lisc. No. 10830 LA Cont. Lisc. No. 34263 LA Cont. Lisc. No. 16724
Item No. Pay Item Quantity Unit Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount
202-02-D  }Removal of Concrete Walks and Drives 1,216 Square Yard | $ 3000 % 36,480.00 | $ 9.00 | $ 10,944.00 | $ 600 $ 7,296.00
202-02-1 |Removal of Existing Culverts 4,784 Linear Foot | $ 800 $ 38,272.00 | § 7.00 | $ 33,488.00 | $ 7001 $ 33,488.00
202-02-]  |Removal of Existing Catch Basins 60 Each $ 175.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 9,000.00
202-02-K  |Removal of Asphalt Drives 88 Square Yard | § 8.00( % 704.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 968.00 | $ 6.001] % 528.00
401-03 Aggregate Surface Course (6") 160 Ton $ 45.001 $ 7,200.00 | $ 5200 $ 832000 | § 66.001 $ 10,560.00
501-01-A  |Asphaltic Concrete (Paved Drives and Turnouts) 86 Ton $ 150.00 { $ 12,900.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 15,050.00 | $ 180.00 { $ 15,480.00
701-06-A  |Side Drain Pipe Arch (17"x13" BCCSPA) 834 Linear Foot | § 28.001 $ 23,352.00 | $ 41.00 | $ 34,194.00 | $ 41.00 | $ 34,194.00
701-06-B  {Side Drain Pipe Arch (21"x15" BCCSPA) 701 Linear Foot | $ 3400 $ 23,834.00 | $ 48.00 | $ 33,648.00 | $ 4500 | $ 31,545.00
701-06-D  |Side Drain Pipe Arch (28"x20" BCCSPA) 886 Linear Foot | § 4150 | $ 36,769.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 44,300.00 | $ 52.00| $ 46,072.00
702-03-A  |Catch Basin (CB-01) 18 Each $ 2,500.00 | $ 45,000.00 | $ 1,750.00 | $ 31,500.00 | $ 2,300.00 | $ 41,400.00
706-02-C  [Concrete Drive (6" Thick) 1,216 Square Yard | $ 38.00 | $ 46,208.00 | $ 4300 $ 52,288.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 60,800.00
713-01 Temporary Signs and Barricades 1 Lump Sum $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 13,000.00 | § 13,000.00
715-01 Topsoil 200 Cubic Yard | $ 18.001 $ 3,600.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 30001 $ 6,000.00
723-02 Granular Material (Vehicular Measurement) 600 Cubic Yard $ 20001 $ 12,000.00 | $ 2000 $ 12,000.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 18,000.00
726-01 Bedding Material (Limestone or Recycled Portland Cement Concrete) 36 Ton $ 45.00 | $ 1,620.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 2,160.00 | $ 56.001 $ 2,016.00
727-01 Mobilization 1 Lump Sum $ 6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 6,500.00 | $ 6,500.00 { $ 24,000.00 | $ 24,000.00
740-01 Construction Layout 1 Lump Sum $ 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00{ $ 8,000.00 | $ 8,000.00
S-001 Saw Cut Concrete Walks and Drives 2,114 Linear Foot $ 500 $ 10,570.00 | $ 8501 $ 17,969.00 | $ 500 $ 10,570.00
S-002 Saw Cut Asphalt Walks and Drives 106 Linear Foot | § 500 $ 530.00 | $ 8.001($ 848.00 | $ 5001 $ 530.00
S-003 Saw Cut Asphalt Roadway 38 Linear Foot | $ 5001 $ 190.00 | $ 9.001 $ 34200 | $ 500 $ 190.00
S-004 Sweep Existing Ditches 5,433 Linear Foot | § 5751% 31,239.75 | $ 4501 $ 24,448.50 | $ 7.00 | $ 38,031.00
BASE BID TOTAL § 353,968.75 $ 354,967.50 3 410,700.00

CERTIFIED BY:

DATE:

Joselfn C. Picciola, 11,

i
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