
 RESIDENTIAL ANTIDISPLACEMENT AND RELOCATION 
 ASSISTANCE PLAN UNDER SECTION 104(d) OF THE HOUSING 
 AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT ACT OF l974, AS AMENDED 
 
The Lafourche Parish Government will replace all occupied and vacant occupiable low/moderate-
income dwelling units demolished or converted to a use other than as low/moderate-income housing 
as a direct result of activities assisted with funds provided under the Housing and Community 
Development Act of 1974, as amended as described in 24 CFR 570.606(b)(1).  The Lafourche Parish 
Government’s Antidisplacement contact person is Thomas Turner, III, Community Services Director 
who can be reached at (985) 493-6901. 
 
All replacement housing will be provided within three years of the commencement of the demolition 
or rehabilitation relating to conversion.  Before obligating or expending funds that will directly 
result in such demolition or conversion, the Lafourche Parish Government will notify the public and 
submit to the Division of Administration the following information in writing: 
 
1.  A description of the proposed assisted activity; 
 
2.  The general location on a map and approximate number of dwelling units by size (number of  
      rooms) that will be demolished or converted to a use other than low/moderate-income dwelling 
     units as a direct result of the assisted activity; 
 
3.  A time schedule for the commencement and completion of the demolition or conversion; 
 
4.  The general location on a map and approximate number of dwelling units by size (number of 
     bedrooms) that will be provided as replacement dwelling units; 
 
5.  The source of funding and a time schedule for the provision of replacement dwelling units; and 
 
6.  The basis for concluding that each replacement dwelling unit will remain in a low/moderate 
      income unit for at least 10 years from the date of initial occupancy. 
 
The Lafourche Parish Government will provide relocation assistance, as described in 570.606(b)(2), 
to each low/moderate-income household displaced by the demolition of housing or by the 
conversion of a low/moderate-income dwelling to another use as a direct result of assisted activities. 
 
Consistent with the goals and objectives of activities assisted under the Act, the Lafourche Parish 
Government will take the following steps to minimize the displacement of persons from their homes; 
 
l.  All public facilities projects (water, sewer, gas, etc.) will be designed so that there will be no 
    displacement of any residences or businesses; 
 
2.  No homes will be demolished that can be rehabilitated; and 
 
3.  There will be no displacement of any residential or business occupants on CDBG projects. 
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 RESIDENTIAL ANTIDISPLACEMENT AND 
  RELOCATION ASSISTANCE CERTIFICATION 
 
The Lafourche Parish Government hereby certifies that it is following a residential antidisplacement 
and relocation assistance plan and that it will comply with the acquisition and relocation 
requirements of the Uniform Relocation Assistance and Real Property Acquisition Policies Act of 
1970 as required under S570.606(a) and HUD implementing regulations at 24 CFR Part 42; the 
requirements in S570.606(b) governing the residential antidisplacement and relocation assistance 
plan under Section 104(d) of the Housing and Community Development Act of l974; the relocation 
requirements of S505.606(c) governing displacement subject to Section 104(d) of the Act; and the 
relocation requirements of 505.606(d) governing optional relocation assistance under Section 
105(a)(11) of the Act. 
 
 
_______________________________                 _________________________________________ 
                       Date                                                                     (Official) 
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 LAFOURCHE PARISH GOVERNMENT 
 
 HANDICAP POLICY AND GRIEVANCE PROCEDURES 
 
 
The Lafourche Parish Government does not discriminate against any handicapped individual or 
group in any of its policies, practices, programs, activities and procedures. 
 
The Lafourche Parish Government has adopted an internal grievance procedure providing for 
prompt and equitable resolution of complaints alleging an action prohibited by the regulation of the 
U.S. Department of Housing and Urban Development, 24 CFR Part 8, implementing Section 504 of 
the Rehabilitation Act of 1973, as amended (Public Law 93-112).  Section 504 states, in part: “ No 
otherwise qualified handicapped individual... shall, solely by reason of his handicap be excluded 
from participation in, be denied the benefits of, or be subjected to discrimination under any program 
or activity receiving Federal financial assistance.”  To further assist those who may have a grievance 
concerning Section 504 compliance, Thomas Turner, III, Community Services Director has been 
designated to coordinate the efforts of the Parish to comply with requirements of Section 504 and its 
implementing regulation, 24 CFR Part 8. 
 
1) Complaints should be in writing, contain the name and address of the person filing it, and  

briefly describe the action alleged to be prohibited by the regulation. 
 
2) Complaints should be filed in the office of the Section 504 Coordinator within a reasonable 

time after the person filing the complaint became aware of the action alleged to be prohibited 
by the regulation. 

 
3) The Section 504 Coordinator will review the complaint and conduct such investigation of  

complaint as may be appropriate to determine its validity and submit a recommendation to 
the Lafourche Parish Government within fifteen (15) days of receiving the complaint. 

 
4) The Lafourche Parish Government will make a decision concerning the complaint within 
thirty (30) days after  

receiving the Section 504 Coordinator’s recommendation. 
 
5) The Section 504 Coordinator will respond to the complaint in writing ten (10) calendar days 

after the Lafourche Parish Government reaches their decision. 
 
6) The Section 504 Coordinator shall maintain the files and records of the Lafourche Parish 
Government relating to  

complaints filed hereunder.  The Section 504 Coordinator may assist with the preparation  
and filing of complaints. 

 
7) The right of a person to prompt and equitable resolution of the complaint filed hereunder  

shall not be impaired by the person’s pursuit of other remedies such as the filing of a Section 
504 complaints with the Department of Housing and Urban Development or other Federal 
or State agencies.  Utilization of this grievance procedure is not a prerequisite to the pursuit  
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of other remedies.  
           
 Complaints may be forwarded for disposition to the: 
 
 Office of Fair Housing and Equal Opportunity 
                                         Department of Housing and Urban Development 
                                         Washington, D.C. 20410 
 

Complaints may also be filed at any Regional or Field Office of the Department such as: 
 

                 Department of Housing and Urban Development 
                 Regional Office  

     Fair Housing and Equal Opportunity Division 
     Post Office Box 2905 
     Fort Worth, TX 76113-2905 

 
8) Determinations made under these procedures shall be liberally constructed to protect the 

substantial rights of interested persons, to meet appropriate due process standards and to 
assure the compliance of the Police Jury with Section 504 and its implementing regulation. 

 
ADOPTION 
 
This Handicap Policy and Grievance Procedure is hereby adopted by the Lafourche Parish 
Government, in regular session on this ______ day of _________________, 2009. 
 
 

______________________________ 
PARISH PRESIDENT 

 
_____________________________________ 
JERRY JONES, CHAIRMAN 
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LAFOURCHE PARISH GOVERNMENT 
POLICY STATEMENT 

FOR COMMUNICATING INFORMATION TO PERSONS WITH  
SENSORY IMPAIRMENTS 

 
POLICY ON PROCEDURES FOR COMMUNICATING INFORMATION 

TO PERSONS WITH SENSORY IMPAIRMENTS 
 

 
The Lafourche Parish Government will take such steps as necessary to insure that 
qualified handicapped persons, including those with impaired sensory skills, receive 
effective notice.  All aids needed to provide this notice, e.g., sign-language interpreters, 
readers, etc., are provided without cost to the person served. 
 
FOR PERSONS WITH HEARING IMPAIRMENTS 
 
1. Qualified sign-language interpreter: 
 

For persons who are hearing impaired and who use sign language as their primary                              
means of communication, the following procedure has been developed and 
resources identified for obtaining the services of a qualified sign-language 
interpreter to communicate both verbal and written information.  The Lafourche 
Parish Government will provide qualified sign-language interpreters on an as 
needed basis.  Such an interpreter will be used at job interviews, large meetings, 
explanations of policies and procedures, etc.  A minimum advance notice for such 
use is three days unless circumstances or conditions dictate lesser time.  In that 
case, the minimum time will be that required for that organization to act.  When 
time permits the request is to be in writing.  If request is made orally, written 
documentation must be prepared and placed in the appropriate file.  The (Grantee 
clerk/secretary) is authorized to obtain an interpreter. 
 
The following organizations will be contacted when an interpreter is needed. 
 
1. Deaf Action Center 
2. Association for the Blind 
 
Information to be furnished when requesting an interpreter. 
 
1. Reason for using interpreter services. 
2. Date and time services are needed. 
3. Place where interpreter is to report and directions if needed. 
4. Name and title of person requesting services. 
5. Name, address and telephone number of the Lafourche Parish 

Government. 
6. How cost for services is to billed.  Understanding of cost (cost per hour, 

travel cost, etc.) 
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7. How interpreter is to be notified in case of cancellation or change in time 
or location. 

8. How Lafourche Parish Government will be notified is services cannot be 
furnished as agreed upon. 

 
2.         Written materials: 
 

All program information will be provided to hearing impaired persons in writing.  
Printed materials and writing materials are available. 

 
FOR PERSONS WITH VISUAL IMPAIRMENTS 
 
1. Reader: 
               
            Staff will communicate the content of written materials by reading them out loud   
            to visually impaired persons.      
 
2.         Large print, taped and Brailled materials. 
       
 
FOR PERSONS WITH MANUAL IMPAIRMENTS 
 
1.         Personal assistance with completing forms and other writing. 
 
2.         Typewriters.   
  
3.         Other adaptive self-help devices.     
 
  

SAMPLE STATEMENT OF NON DISCRIMINATION 
 
The Lafourche Parish Government does not discriminate on the basis of handicapped 
status in admission or access to, or treatment or employment in its Federally assisted 
programs and activities in violation of Section 504 of the Rehabilitation Act of 1973, as 
amended and its implementing HUD Regulation (24CFR Part 8, dated June 2, 1988).  A 
Lafourche Parish Government official has been designated as the coordinator for 
implementation of this policy. 
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On motion by ____________, seconded by ______________, the following resolution 
was introduced and adopted; 
 

RESOLUTION NO. ____ 
 

RESOLUTION APPROVING THE HIRING OF MARTIN GLYNN 
OF TRI PARISH APPRAISAL FOR THE PURPOSE OF 
APPRAISING THE PROPERTY LOCATED AT 1709 
RIDGEFIELD ROAD, THIBODAUX, LOUISIANA AND FURTHER 
AUTHORIZING THE PARISH PRESIDENT TO PROCEED, 
INCLUDING HIRING AN ATTORNEY TO PERFORM A TITLE 
SEARCH ON THE PROPERTY, ENTER INTO A PURCHASE 
AGREEMENT AND TO SIGN, EXECUTE, AND ADMINISTER 
ANY AND ALL RELEVANT DOCUMENTS AND AMENDMENTS.  

 
WHEREAS, an appraisal is necessary to determine the “Fair Market Value” of 

said property; and  
 
WHEREAS, Martin Glynn of Tri Parish Appraisal has submitted a proposal to 

appraise the property located in Thibodaux, Louisiana (see attached proposal); and  
 
WHEREAS, council authorizes the Parish President to make an offer for 

purchase, enter into a purchase agreement, and to hire an attorney to conduct a title 
search on the property located at 1709 Ridgefield Road, Thibodaux, Louisiana; and  

 
WHEREAS, assuming free and clear merchantable title, the Parish President is 

authorized to sign, execute, and administer any and all relevant documents; and  
 
WHEREAS, if the appraisal is received and council is willing to move forward 

with a purchase of said property an ordinance will be submitted to council with the 
purchase price; and  
 

WHEREAS, this resolution was sponsored for Administration by Mr. Jerry 
Jones, Councilman, District 1; and, 
 
 WHEREAS, it is recommended by the Administration of the Lafourche 
Parish Government that the Council approves hiring Tri Parish Appraisal and 
further authorizes the Parish President to make an offer for purchase, enter into a 
purchase agreement at or below appraised value, not to exceed list price, and to 
hire an attorney to conduct a title search for the property located at 1709 
Ridgefield Road, Thibodaux, Louisiana. Further, it is recommended that the 
council authorize the Parish President to sign, execute, and administer any and 
all relevant documents and amendments if there is free and clear title to said 
property.  
 



THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Lafourche Parish Council 
convened in regular session on ______________, and does hereby approve hiring Tri 
Parish Appraisal for an appraisal of 1709 Ridgefield Road, Thibodaux, Louisiana; and  
 
 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Lafourche Parish Council hereby 
authorizes the Parish President to hire an attorney to conduct a title search of the property 
located at 1709 Ridgefield Road, Thibodaux, Louisiana; and  
 
 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Lafourche Parish Council hereby 
authorizes the Parish President to enter into a purchase agreement at or below appraised 
value, not to exceed list price; and  
 
 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Lafourche Parish Council does hereby 
authorize the Parish President to sign, execute, and administer any and all relevant 
documents and amendments; and  
 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that a certified copy of this resolution shall be 
forwarded to Tri Parish Appraisal (1517 Polk Street Houma, LA 70361 Attn: Martin 
Glynn); Lafourche Parish Government Department of Parks, Recreation, and Public 
Facilities, Department of Finance, and the Office of the Parish Administrator. 
 
  This resolution having been submitted to a vote, the vote thereon was as follows: 

 
YEAS: 
 
NAYS: 
 
ABSENT: 

 
And the resolution was declared adopted this             day of _____________. 

 
 
 

_______________________________ 
JERRY JONES,    CHAIRMAN     
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL 

 
 
___________________________________________ 
CARLEEN B. BABIN, COUNCIL CLERK 
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL 
 
 

* * * * * * * * * * 
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I, CARLEEN B. BABIN, Council Clerk for the Lafourche Parish Council, do hereby 
certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of Resolution No. _______                           
adopted by the Assembled Council in Regular Session on                                               , at 
which meeting a quorum was present. 
 
GIVEN UNDER MY OFFICIAL SIGNATURE AND SEAL OF OFFICE THIS ______, 
DAY OF                                         , 2009. 
 
 

_______________________________________    
CARLEEN B. BABIN, COUNCIL CLERK 
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL 
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TRI PARISH APPRAISAL  
        1517 Polk Street 

         HOUMA, LOUISIANA  70361 
        Phone  879-2479 - FAX 851-5485 
   ────────── ──────── ─────────────────────────────────

APPRAISAL BID PROPOSAL 
 
 
 

DATE:     July 2, 2009 
 
CLIENT:   Ms. Crystal Chiasson 
  Lafourche Parish Government 
  P.O. Drawer 5548 
  Thibodaux, LA  70302 
   
 You have requested that a bid be submitted for the appraisal of 
the following described property: 
 

1709 Ridgefield Road 
Thibodaux, LA 

 
 The purpose of the appraisal will be to determine the "Fair 
Market Value" of the subject property, as of the date of the 
appraisal.  The appraisal will contain the necessary documentation to 
support the final estimate of value relative to this purpose. 
 
 The contract relationship shall exist between Central Appraisal 
Systems, Inc. and the Lafourche Parish Government (Client).  The 
estimated time for completion of this assignment is three to four 
weeks.  Upon completion of the assignment, one original and one copy 
of the appraisal report shall be forwarded to the above named CLIENT 
along with an invoice for each of the professional services. 
 
 The fee for our services in preparing the appraisal report, as 
herein outlined, will be: $2,200.00.  This fee is due and payable upon 
receipt of the appraisal report by the CLIENT.  It is understood that 
the appraisal fee is not contingent upon the value conclusions. The 
appraisal fee does not include any costs of court testimony or pre-
trial conferences.  The appraisal shall be contingent upon the 
Underlying Assumptions, Appraiser's Certification and Appraiser's 
Qualifications, a copy of which are attached to this bid proposal. 
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Page 2 
Appraisal Bid 
 
 
 
 
 The following items will need to be furnished by the client prior 
to the start date of this appraisal: 
 
  1.  Name and phone number of contact person at property location 
      
 
 Please indicate your acceptance of the terms of this proposal by 
returning a signed copy to my attention.  I look forward to working 
with you and will begin the appraisal as soon as confirmation and the 
requested items have been received.  If you have any questions 
concerning the appraisal process or this agreement, please let me 
know. 
 
 
 
 
        Respectfully submitted, 
 
 
 
       
        Martin A. Glynn 
        Louisiana State Certified 
        General Appraiser #34 
 
 
Acceptance:                                                       
           (Client or Agent)          (Date)
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UNDERLYING ASSUMPTIONS AND LIMITING CONDITIONS 
 
A. The legal description furnished is assumed to be correct. 
 
B. I assume no responsibility for matters legal in character, nor do I render any opinion as to title, which 

is assumed to be marketable.  All existing liens and encumbrances have been disregarded and the 
property is appraised as though free and clear under responsible ownership and competent manage-
ment. 

 
C. Unless otherwise noted herein, it is assumed that there are no encroachments, zoning violations or 

unusual restrictions existing in the subject property. 
 
D. Information, estimates and opinions contained in this report are obtained from sources considered 

reliable; however, the appraiser can assume no liability for “Third Parties”. 
 
E. Possession of this report, or a copy thereof, does not carry with it the right of publication, nor may it 

be used for any purpose by any but the applicant without the previous written consent of the 
appraiser or the applicant, and in any event, only with proper qualification. 

 
F. I am not required to give testimony or attendance in court by reason of this appraisal, with reference 

to the property in question, unless arrangements have been made previously therefore. 
 
G. The division of the land and improvements values estimated herein is applicable only under the 

program of utilization shown.  These separate valuations are invalidated by any other application. 
 
H. I will not divulge the material (evaluation) contents of the report, analytical findings or conclusions, 

or give a copy of the appraisal report to anyone other than the client or his designee as specified in 
writing except as may be required by a court of law or body with the power of subpoena. 

 
I. The appraisal is based on there being no hidden, unapparent, or apparent conditions of the site, 

subsoil, or structures that would adversely affect the marketability, or value of the property.  No 
responsibility is assumed for any such conditions, nor do I possess the expertise in the environmental 
and engineering fields required to discover such conditions.  The condition and adequacy of the 
Mechanical, Heating, Cooling, Ventilating, Electrical and Plumbing equipment is considered to be 
commensurate with the condition of the balance of the improvements unless otherwise stated.   

 
J. The Appraiser assignment is not based on a requested minimum valuation, a specific valuation, or the 

approval of a loan. 
 
 
  
      
        Martin A. Glynn 
        Louisiana State Certified General 
        Real Estate Appraiser, #34 
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 APPRAISER'S CERTIFICATION 
 
I, Martin A. Glynn ("APPRAISER"), hereby warrant and certify that: 
 
- The appraisal report attached hereto fully complies with all of the requirements and standards of the 

appraisal regulation (the "Regulation") adopted by the federal regulatory agency(s) pursuant to Title 
XI of the Financial Institutional Reform, Recovery and Enforcement Act of 1989, including but not 
limited to the applicable Uniform Standards of Professional Appraisal Practice adopted as an 
appendix to that Regulation, as well as the specific standards set forth in the Regulation. 

 
- The Departure Provision of the USPAP has not been applied. 
 
- I personally inspected the subject property of the report. 
 
- The statements of fact contained in the appraisal report are true and correct. 
 
- The reported analysis, opinions and conclusions are limited only by the reported assumptions and 

limiting conditions and are my personal unbiased professional analysis, opinions and conclusion. 
 
- I have no present or prospective interest in the property that is the subject of the report, and I have 

no personal interest or bias with respect to the parties involved. 
 
- The appraisal requirement was not based on a requested valuation, a specific valuation, or the 

approval of a loan. 
 
- My compensation is not contingent upon the reporting of a predetermined value or direction in value 

that favors the cause of the client, the amount of the value estimate, the attainment of a stipulated 
result or the occurrence of a subsequent event. 

 
- My education, experience and knowledge is sufficient to appraise the type of property being 

appraised and that no appraiser has provided significant professional assistance other than the co-
signing appraiser. 

 
 
 
       
      
  
        Martin A. Glynn 
        Louisiana State Certified General 
        Real Estate Appraiser, #34 

hardentl
ITEM 66



                L 
           

 APPRAISER’S QUALIFICATIONS'S QUALIFICATIONS 
 MARTIN A. GLYNN 
 
 
PROFESSIONAL AFFILIATIONS AND ACTIVITIES: 
 
1. American Society of Appraisers.  First Vice-President, New Orleans Chapter for 1989-1990, President, 

1990 - 1991, Louisiana State Director 1991 - 1992. 
 
2. Louisiana State Certified General Real Estate Appraiser, #34. 
 
3. Member Bayou Board of REALTORS and Bayou Board of REALTORS Multiple Listing Service.  

Orientation Chairman, 1985, 1984 Recipient of the "REALTOR of the Year", President for 1989. 
 
4. Member Louisiana REALTORS Association. 
 
5. Member National Association of REALTORS. 
 
6. Member Houma/Terrebonne and Thibodaux Chambers of Commerce. 
 
7. Member Better Business Bureau. 
 
8. Approved Building Inspector for the Louisiana Home Builders Association, Home Owner's Warranty 

Corporation. 
 
9. Instructor, certified by the Louisiana Real Estate Commission, for pre-license and continuing 

education courses. 
 
10. Professional Standards Instructor, certified by National Association of REALTORS. 
 
11. Member Louisiana Home Builders Association, Secretary of the Southeastern Louisiana Home 

Builders Association, 1983, Treasurer, 1984 and 1985. 
 
12. Real Estate Educators Association; 1984 Treasurer of the Louisiana Chapter, 1985 Vice President. 
 
13. Chairman, Professional Standards Committee, Louisiana REALTORS Association, 1990, Bayou Board 

of REALTORS 1991, 1992, 1993, 1994, 1995. 
 
14. Past member, Louisiana Real Estate Commission, Appraiser's Sub-Committee responsible for 

implementation and enforcement of the Louisiana Appraisal Certification Law from 1989 - 1992.  
 
15. Licensed Real Estate Broker, Louisiana. 
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EDUCATION (Over 800 classroom hours of real estate education): 
 
1. Graduate B.A. Degree, Nicholls State University, 1974 
 
2. Graduate REALTORS Institute, having successfully completed GRI Courses I, II, and III sponsored 

by the Louisiana REALTORS Association. 
 
3. Successful completion of the following National Association of Independent Fee Appraisers Courses 

and Seminars: 
 A. Income Property Appraising 
 B. Farm-Ranch-Rural Appraising 
 C. Investment Analysis 
 D. Condominium Valuation 
 E. Mortgage Equity Analysis 
 F. Cash Equivalency of Creative Financing 
 G. Depreciation 
 H. Compound Interest in Today's Real Estate Market 
 I. Condemnation Appraisals 
 J. The Value of a Tree 
 K. Manufactured Housing Appraising 
 L. Appraisal Guidelines in the Use of FNMA Forms 1004 and 1025 and the Treatment of the 

Adjustments for Market Rates in Financing on the FNMA Forms sponsored by the New 
Orleans Chapter. 

 M. Professional Standards 
 N. Narrative Report Writing 
 O. FHLMC Single Family report Writing Seminar 
 P. Income Valuation 2.0 
 Q Market Data Analysis of Residential Real Estate 1.2 
 
4. Attended the following seminars sponsored by the Louisiana REALTORS Association. 
 A. Louisiana Estates, Wills and Trusts 
 B. Estate Planning and Taxation 
 C. Market Strategies for Today's Market 
 D. Pricing Residential Properties 
 E. Tax Strategies After Tax Reform. 
 Attended the Professional Standards Certification Seminar in Chicago, IL sponsored by the National 

Association of REALTORS as the selected candidate of the Louisiana REALTORS Association. 
 
5. Attended seminars entitled "Effective Planning for the Typical Small Business Owner" and "Financial 

Statement Analysis" co-sponsored by Nicholls State University Small Business Development Center, 
and the U.S. Small Business Administration. 

 
6. Successful completion of the following Marshall and Swift Seminars: 
 A. Residential Cost Valuation 
 B. Commercial Cost Valuation 
 
7. Successful completion of the following American Institute of Real Estate Appraisers Seminars: 
 A. Principles of Business Valuation seminar 
 B. Residential Case Studies Course 210 
 C. FIRREA Compliance for Fee Appraisers 
 D. Real Estate Appraiser Liability and Loss Prevention Seminars 
 E. The New U.R.A.R. Seminars 
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8. Successful completion of the following National Association of Review Appraisers and Mortgage 
Underwriter's seminars: 

 A. Principles of Condominium and Apartment Appraisal Review 
 B. Principles of Review Appraising 
 C. FNMA's Underwriting Guidelines 
 
9. Successful completion of the Society of Real Estate Appraisers' seminar: 
 A. Adjusting for Financing Differences in Residential Properties 
 B. #R-41b of the Federal Home Loan Bank Board 
 C. Revision of Appraisal Forms 
 D. FNMA Appraisal Guidelines 
 
10. Successful completion of the Louisiana Real Estate Commission seminars: 
 A. Residential Energy Usage and the Contribution to Market Value 
 B. Creative Financing (2 separate seminars) 
 C. Condominium Seminar 
 D. 1983 Financing Update Seminar 
 E. Seller Financing Methods and Import on Appraisal Value 
 F. Federal Legislation & Regulations Affecting Real Estate Transactions 

 G. Residential Appraisals: Content, Consistency, and Usefulness 
 H. How to avoid Libelous Actions in Real Estate Transactions 
 I. Current Techniques in Acquiring, Managing and Disposing of Investment Properties 
 J. Land Syndication 
 K. Real Estate Instructor Workshop 
 L. Financing in a Changing Market 
 M. Marketing Strategies in Today's Economy 
 N. Contemporary Appraisal Practice 
 O. Wetland Regulations (University of New Orleans) 
 P. Commercial Property and Mortgage Financing in the 90's (University of New Orleans) 
 Q.  Agency Disclosure 
 R. Property Management of 1 Family Rentals and Fair Housing (University of New 

Orleans) 
 S. Commercial Property Management and Environmental Issues (University of New 

Orleans) 
 T. Advanced Financing 
 U. Valuation of Income Properties 
 
11. Successful completion of the following American Society of Appraiser's Courses. 
 A. Real Property III, Income Processing and Analysis 
 B. Uniform Standards of Professional Appraisal Practice 
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 The American Society of Appraisers has a mandatory program of continuing education for 
designated members.  Those who meet the minimum standards of the program are considered 
to have re-certified.  I am certified under this program through March 6, 2004. 

 
12. Successful completion of the Institute of Business Appraisers Inc.'s seminar on Appraising 

Businesses. 
 
13. Successful completion of the 22nd Annual Educational Refresher Seminar sponsored by 

Region 2 of the International Right Of Way Association and the Texas Transportation 
Institute. 

 
14. Successful completion of the Condemnation Update Seminar sponsored by Louisiana Chapter 

43 of The International Right Of Way Association. 
 
15. Successful completion of the Home Owner's Warranty Fee Inspector Training program 

sponsored by Louisiana Home Owners Warranty Corporation. 
 
16. Successful completion of Relocation Appraisal Seminar (1987) sponsored by Employee 

Relocation Council. 
 
17. Successful completion of the Fannie Mae Louisiana REO Appraisal Seminar sponsored by 

Federal National Mortgage Association. 
 
18. Successful completion of the seminar on the current real estate conditions and appraisal 

challenges in 1987 for Texas, Oklahoma, Louisiana, and Mississippi sponsored by Merrill 
Lynch Relocation Management Company. 

 
19. Successful completion of the VA and Conventional Loan Guaranty Seminar sponsored by First 

Federal Savings and Loan Association. 
 
20. Successful completion of the ABC's of REO's Seminar sponsored by the Women's Council of 

REALTORS, New Orleans Chapter. 
 
21. Certified as an Expert Appraisal Witness in the following courts: 
 A. Terrebonne Parish 32nd Judicial District Court-Divisions A, B, C, D 
 B. Lafourche Parish 17th Judicial District Court-Divisions A, B, C, D 
 C. United Stated Bankruptcy Court for the Eastern, Western and Middle Districts of 

Louisiana 
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EXPERIENCE: 
 
 
 Presently and since February, 1976, I, Martin A. Glynn have been engaged in general real estate 
practice as the President of Central Appraisal Systems, Inc. I am experienced in the sale, management, and 
appraising of real property. 
 
 Central Appraisal Systems, Inc. has executed appraisal assignments for numerous clients including 
governmental agencies, oil companies, estates, corporations and individuals.  Appraisals have been made 
covering the valuation of all types of property including residential single family, residential multi-family, 
motels, shopping centers, industrial warehouses, general commercial buildings, unimproved acreage, 
industrial and residential developments, individual lots, and entire subdivisions. 
 
 Some of the current and past clients are:  McDermott, Inc., Farmers Home Administration, St. Mary 
Water Works District I, Houma/Terrebonne Airport Commission, Terrebonne Parish Consolidated 
Government, Exxon Pipeline Co., Exxon U.S.A., City of New Orleans, Texaco, Kerr McGee, Merrill Lynch 
Relocation Management, Homequity Relocation Co., and many individuals and lending institutions 
including Meritrust Federal Savings Bank, American Bank of Houma, Texas State Commerce Bank, City 
National Bank of Baton Rouge, Hibernia Bank of New Orleans, First National Bank of Jefferson, Premier 
Bank of South Louisiana, Bayoulands Bank, First National Bank of Commerce, Resolution Trust Corporation, 
First National Bank of Houma, Secor Federal Savings Bank, South Louisiana Bank, U.S. Small Business 
Administration, Federal Savings & Loan Insurance Corp., and Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation. 
 
 I am actively involved in Real Estate Education as an Instructor for the Bayou Board of Realtors.  I 
have assisted Educational Testing Service in the formulation of Appraisal Test Guidelines for use with 
Individual State Appraisal Certification Laws.  I have written articles, which have been published in various 
trade journals and are a contributing author of the Real Estate textbook used by the American School of Real 
Estate.  The National Association of REALTORS certifies me as a Professional Standards Procedures 
Instructor. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
             
        Martin A. Glynn 
        Louisiana State Certified General 
        Real Estate Appraiser, #34 
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On motion by ___________________, seconded by _______________________, the 
following resolution was introduced and adopted; 
 

RESOLUTION NO. ____ 
 

RESOLUTION HIRING PICCIOLA & ASSOCIATES, INC. FOR 
ENGINEERING SERVICES TO PREPARE AND SUBMIT A 
HAZARD MITIGATION GRANT PROGRAM APPLICATION 
PERTAINING TO ACQUISITIONS OF HOMES AND 
AUTHORIZING THE PARISH PRESIDENT TO SIGN, EXECUTE 
AND ADMINISTER SAID AGREEMENT AND ANY AND ALL 
RELEVANT DOCUMENTS. 

WHEREAS, in the fall of 2008 Hurricanes Gustav and Ike made landfall in the 
State of Louisiana, causing damage to properties in Lafourche Parish; and 

 WHEREAS,  the Federal Emergency Management Agency (Grantor) has 
recently made funding available to the State of Louisiana through the Governor’s Office 
of Homeland Security and Emergency Preparedness (Grantee) for Lafourche Parish for 
mitigation projects as a result of Hurricanes Gustav and Ike through its Hazard Mitigation 
Grant Program; and  

 WHEREAS, Lafourche Parish Government has received an allocation through 
the funding mentioned above in the total amount of SIX MILLION FOUR HUNDRED 
TWENTY-FIVE THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED EIGHTY-SEVEN AND NO/100 
($6,425,787.00) DOLLARS for mitigation type projects, including acquisitions and 
elevations of homes; and 

WHEREAS, the application deadline to submit applications for the allocation 
mentioned above is August 31, 2009; and 

 
WHEREAS, Lafourche Parish Government’s Grants & Economic Development 

Department was already working with Picciola & Associates on the Hurricane Katrina 
and Rita Acquisition and Elevation projects; and 

 
WHEREAS, it is the recommendation of Administration that Picciola & 

Associates, Inc. be contracted for engineering services to prepare and submit a Hazard 
Mitigation Grant Program applications pertaining to acquisitions of homes on behalf of 
Lafourche Parish Government; and 

 
WHEREAS, this resolution was sponsored for Administration by Mr. Lindel 

Toups, Councilman District 6; and 
 
 WHEREAS, it is recommended by the Administration of the Lafourche 
Parish Government that the Council approve an Agreement with Picciola & 
Associates, Inc. for engineering services to prepare and submit a Hazard 
Mitigation Grant Program application pertaining to acquisitions of homes on 
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behalf of Lafourche Parish Government and authorizes the Parish President to sign, 
execute and administer said agreement and any and all relevant documents.   
 

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Lafourche Parish Council 
convened in regular session on July 14, 2009, and does hereby approve an Agreement 
with Picciola & Associates, Inc. for engineering services to prepare and submit a Hazard 
Mitigation Grant Program application pertaining to acquisitions of homes on behalf of 
Lafourche Parish Government; and authorizing the Parish President to sign, execute and 
administer said contract and any and all relevant documents. 
 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that a certified copy of this resolution shall be 
forwarded to Picciola & Associates, Inc., Attn: Joe Picciola, P. O. Box 687, Cut Off, LA   
70345; Lafourche Parish Government Office of Emergency Preparedness, Department of 
Finance, Grants & Economic Development Department; and the Office of the Parish 
Administrator. 
 
  This resolution having been submitted to a vote, the vote thereon was as follows: 

 
YEAS:   
 
NAYS: 
 
ABSENT:   

 
And the resolution was declared adopted this   ____     day of 

____________________, 2009. 
 
 
 

_______________________________ 
JERRY JONES, CHAIRMAN     
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL 

 
 
___________________________________________ 
CARLEEN B. BABIN, COUNCIL CLERK 
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL 
 
 

* * * * * * * * * * 
 

I, CARLEEN B. BABIN, Council Clerk for the Lafourche Parish Council, do hereby 
certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of Resolution No.                           
adopted by the Assembled Council in Regular Session on                                               , at 
which meeting a quorum was present. 
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GIVEN UNDER MY OFFICIAL SIGNATURE AND SEAL OF OFFICE THIS ______, 
DAY OF                                         , 2009. 
 
 

_______________________________________    
CARLEEN B. BABIN, COUNCIL CLERK 
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL 
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On motion by ____________, seconded by ______________, the following resolution 
was introduced and adopted; 
 

RESOLUTION NO. ____ 
 

RESOLUTION AMENDING THE CONTRACT ENTITLED ROAD 
SALES TAX DISTRICT 2, 4F PROJECT, ROADWAY AND 
DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (RESOLUTION NO. 09-212)  
BETWEEN LAFOURCHE PARISH GOVERNMENT AND  
PICCIOLA & ASSOCIATES, INC.; AND AUTHORIZING THE 
PARISH PRESIDENT TO SIGN, EXECUTE, AND ADMINISTER 
SAID AMENDMENT AND ANY AND ALL RELEVANT 
DOCUMENTS. 
  

 WHEREAS,  council by Resolution 09-212 approved a contract with Picciola & 
Associates, Inc. with attached street list including cost estimates for the project entitled 
“RSTD 2, 4F Roadway and Drainage Improvements”; and  
 
 WHEREAS, the street list has been amended to add the following streets at an 
estimated cost of $946,392.70 (amended street list attached as Exhibit A): 
 

 West 13th Street 
 West 107th Street to Levee 
 West 107th Place 
 West 122nd Street @ Ave A 
 West 205th Street 
 Hwy 308 to East 116th Street 
 Yankee Canal Road 

 
WHEREAS, this resolution was sponsored for Administration by Mr. Daniel 

Lorraine, Councilman, District 9; and 
 
 WHEREAS, it is recommended by the Administration of the Lafourche 
Parish Government that the Council approves said amendment to the contract 
with Picciola & Associates for Road Sales Tax District 2, Project 4F, Roadway 
and Drainage Improvements and authorizing the Parish President to sign, 
execute, and administer said amendment and any and all relevant documents.  
 
 THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Lafourche Parish Council 
convened in regular session on July 14, 2009, and does hereby approve the amended 
contract with Picciola & Associates, Inc. to provide engineering services for Road Sales 
Tax District 2, Project 4F, Roadway and Drainage Improvements; and authorizes the 
Parish President to sign, execute, and administer said amendment and any and all relevant 
documents.  
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BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that a certified copy of this resolution shall be 
forwarded to Joseph Picciola, Picciola & Associates, Inc., P.O. Box 687, Cut Off, LA 
70345;  the Lafourche Parish Government Department of Finance, Department of Public 
Works, and the Office of the Parish Administrator. 
 
  This resolution having been submitted to a vote, the vote thereon was as follows: 

 
YEAS: 
NAYS: 
ABSENT: 

 
And the resolution was declared adopted this             day of _____________, 

2009. 
 
 
 
 

_______________________________ 
JERRY JONES, CHAIRMAN     
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL 

 
 
___________________________________________ 
CARLEEN B. BABIN, COUNCIL CLERK 
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL 
 
 
    * * * * * * * * * * 
 
I, CARLEEN B. BABIN, Council Clerk for the Lafourche Parish Council, do hereby 
certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of Resolution No.                     
adopted by the Assembled Council in Regular Session on                                               , at 
which meeting a quorum was present. 
 
GIVEN UNDER MY OFFICIAL SIGNATURE AND SEAL OF OFFICE THIS ______, 
DAY OF                                         , 2009. 
 
 

_______________________________________   
CARLEEN B. BABIN, COUNCIL CLERK 
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL 
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AMENDMENT #1 TO AGREEMENT FOR ENGINEERING SERVICES DATED  
June 2009. 

 
 AMENDMENT #1 entered into on this___ day of __________, 2009 by and 
between LAFOURCHE PARISH GOVERNMENT, a political subdivision of the State of 
Louisiana, with the current mailing address of PO DRAWER 5548, Thibodaux, 
Louisiana (hereinafter referred to as “OWNER”), duly represented by Charlotte A. 
Randolph, Parish President, and PICCIOLA & ASSOCIATES, INC, Post Office Box 
687, Cut Off, LA 70345, duly represented by Joseph Picciola (hereinafter referred to as 
“ENGINEER”.) 
 

WITNESSETH 
That OWNER and ENGINEER entered into a contract for engineering services recorded 
in the Parish records on June 25, 2009 under Entry Number 1072963, Book 1383, Page 
879. 
 
WHEREAS, OWNER and ENGINEER have agreed to amend the Agreement as follows: 
 
Amendment #1 to the contract entitled RSTD 2, 4F Project, Roadway and Drainage 
Improvements adds the following 7 streets: West 13th Street, West 107th Street to Levee, 
and West 107th Place, West 122nd Street @ Ave A, West 205th Street, Hwy 308 to East 
116th Street, and Yankee Canal Road (amended street list attached as Exhibit A). 
 

THUS DONE AND SIGNED at Thibodaux, Louisiana in the presence of the 
undersigned competent witnesses, on this       day of                 , 2009. 

 
 

 
Witnesses: LAFOURCHE PARISH 

GOVERNMENT 
 
      By:       
       Charlotte A. Randolph 
       Parish President 
      Date:      
 
 
      PICCIOLA AND ASSOCIATES 
 
      By:       
       Joseph Picciola 
       President 
      Date:      
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Road Sales Tax District No. 2, 4F 
Listing of Streets

Description of Proposed Work

Original contract  

Res‐09‐212 
6/9/09 Amendment #1

7/14/09

Ridgewood Blvd. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Roy St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Pearl St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Mable St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Marco St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Lexie St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
W.M. Stall St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Circle‐G St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
C&L Lane reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Guilbeau St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Jeannette Ave. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Carolyne Ave. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Harold Ave. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Oakridge Dr. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Legion Lane reconstruction x
Plaisance St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Fred St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Texas Rd. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Dursette St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Alcide St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Bob's Lane reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Nichols St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
N.1st St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
N.2nd St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
N. 3rd St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Jefferson St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Whitney Lane reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Henry St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Terrebonne Lane reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Nicol Lane reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Pierce St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Picciola Lane reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Tamplain Lane reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Leon St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
St. Mary St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Rue Pouche Vide reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Verret St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
South Henry reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Alexin St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Williams Rd. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
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B&R Lane reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Harry St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Washington St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Theriot St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Falgout Lane reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Meadow Lane reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Louviere Lane reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Chouest Lane reconstruction & incidental drainage x
West 11th St. reconstruction x
West 13th St. reconstruction x
West 107th St. to Levee reconstruction x
West 107th Pl. reconstruction x
West 122nd St. @ Ave A reconstruction & incidental drainage x
West 205th St. pot hole repairs x

Hwy 308 to E. 116th St. reconstruction & incidental drainage x
Yankee Canal Road reconstruct 300' section x

Amendment #1 adds 7 streets (as noted in column 4) at an estimated cost of $946,392.70

Exhibit A

hardentl
ITEM 71



On motion by ____________, seconded by ______________, the following resolution 
was introduced and adopted; 
 

RESOLUTION NO. ____ 
 

RESOLUTION ACCEPTING THE LOW BID FROM DOLPHIN 
SERVICES, INC. IN THE AMOUNT OF $1,933,857.80 FOR 
REPAIRS TO THE COTE BLANCHE BRIDGE AND 
AUTHORIZING THE PARISH PRESIDENT TO SIGN, EXECUTE, 
AND ADMINISTER A CONTRACT AND ANY AND ALL 
RELEVANT DOCUMENTS.   
 
WHEREAS, bids were received on July 2nd as follows: 
 
 Dolphin Services, Inc.    $ 1,933,857.80 
 Coastal Bridge Company, L.L.C.  $ 2,352,745.00 
 Cajun Maritime, L.L.C.   $ 2,520,272.00 
 Low Land Construction Co., Inc.  No Bid 
 JAG Construction Services, Inc.  No Bid 
 F. Miller Construction, L.L.C.  No Bid 
 Bollinger Shipyard Lockport, L.L.C.  No Bid 
 
WHEREAS, the lowest bidder was Dolphin Services, Inc. in the amount of  

$ 1,933,857.80; and   
 
 WHEREAS, it is recommended by Picciola & Associates, Inc. and this 
Administration that the low bid of Dolphin Services, Inc. be accepted; and  
 

WHEREAS, this resolution was sponsored for Administration by Mr. Rodney 
Doucet, Councilman, District 8; and 
 
 WHEREAS, it is recommended by the Administration of the 
Lafourche Parish Government that the Council approves the low bid from 
Dolphin Services, Inc. for repairs to the Cote Blanche Bridge in the amount 
of $1,933,857.80 and authorizes the Parish President to sign, execute, and 
administer said contract and any and all relevant documents.  
 
 THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Lafourche Parish Council 
convened in regular session on July 14, 2009, and does hereby approve the low bid from 
Dolphin Services, Inc. for repairs to the Cote Blanche Bridge in the amount of 
$1,933,857.80 and authorizes the Parish President to sign, execute, and administer said 
contract and any and all relevant documents.  

 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that a certified copy of this resolution shall be 

forwarded to Picciola & Associates, Inc. (P.O. Box 687, Cut Off, LA 70345); Lafourche 
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Parish Government Department of Public Works, Department of Finance, and the Office 
of the Parish Administrator. 
 
  This resolution having been submitted to a vote, the vote thereon was as follows: 

 
 
YEAS: 
 
NAYS: 
 
ABSENT: 

 
And the resolution was declared adopted this             day of _____________. 

 
 
 

_______________________________ 
JERRY JONES,    CHAIRMAN     
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL 

 
 
___________________________________________ 
CARLEEN B. BABIN, COUNCIL CLERK 
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL 
 
 

* * * * * * * * * * 
 

I, CARLEEN B. BABIN, Council Clerk for the Lafourche Parish Council, do hereby 
certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of Resolution No. _______                           
adopted by the Assembled Council in Regular Session on                                               , at 
which meeting a quorum was present. 
 
GIVEN UNDER MY OFFICIAL SIGNATURE AND SEAL OF OFFICE THIS ______, 
DAY OF                                         , 2009. 
 
 

_______________________________________    
CARLEEN B. BABIN, COUNCIL CLERK 
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL 

 

hardentl
ITEM 72



hardentl
ITEM 72



hardentl
ITEM 72



hardentl
ITEM 72















YEAS: 
 
NAYS: 
 
ABSENT: 

 
And the resolution was declared adopted this             day of _____________, 

2009. 
 
 
 

_______________________________ 
JERRY JONES, CHAIRMAN     
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL 

 
 
___________________________________________ 
CARLEEN B. BABIN, COUNCIL CLERK 
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL 
 
 

* * * * * * * * * * 
 

I, CARLEEN B. BABIN, Council Clerk for the Lafourche Parish Council, do hereby 
certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of Resolution No.                           
adopted by the Assembled Council in Regular Session on                                               , at 
which meeting a quorum was present. 
 
GIVEN UNDER MY OFFICIAL SIGNATURE AND SEAL OF OFFICE THIS ______, 
DAY OF                                         , 2009. 
 
 

_______________________________________   
CARLEEN B. BABIN, COUNCIL CLERK 
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL 
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