LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL
APRIL 28, 2009
UNANIMOUS AGENDA

A. RESOLUTIONS:

1. RESOLUTION accepting the low bid from Huey Stockstill, Inc., in the amount of
$770,873.50 for the project entitled Farm to Market Road (Raceland Sugars (Phases
A and B), Gheens Shortcut Road (Phase A), and Raceland Senior Citizens Parking
Lot); and authorizing the Parish President to sign, execute and administer said contract
and associated documents. (L. TOUPS FOR ADMINISTRATION)

2. RESOLUTION accepting the low bid from Huey Stockstill, Inc., in the amount of
$1,443,574.60 for the project entitled Roadway and Drainage Improvements in Road
Sales Tax District No. 2 - Phase 4E and authorizing the Parish President to sign,

execute and administer said contract and associated documents.
(D. LORRAINE FOR ADMINISTRATION)
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On motion by , seconded by , the following resolution
was introduced and adopted;

RESOLUTION NO.

A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING THE LOW BID FROM HUEY
STOCKSTILL, INC. IN THE AMOUNT OF $770,873.50 FOR THE
PROJECT ENTITLED FARM TO MARKET ROAD (RACELAND
SUGARS (PHASES A AND B), GHEENS SHORTCUT ROAD
(PHASE A), AND RACELAND SR. CITIZENS PARKING LOT),
AND AUTHORIZING THE PARISH PRESIDENT TO SIGN,
EXECUTE, AND ADMINISTER SAID CONTRACT AND
ASSOCIATED DOCUMENTS.

WHEREAS, the Engineer for this project, T. Baker Smith, Inc. legally
advertised the project in the official journal; and

WHEREAS, the bids were received and read publicly on April 21, 2009 as
follows:
Barriere Construction Co. LLC $861,543.50
Huey Stockstill, Inc. $770,873.50

WHEREAS, the low bidder is Huey Stockstill, Inc. in the amount of
$770,873.50; and

WHEREAS, it is the recommendation of T. Baker Smith Inc., and the
Administration of Lafourche Parish Government that the low bid of Huey
Stockstill, Inc. be accepted; and

WHEREAS, this resolution was sponsored for Administration by Mr. Lindel
Toups, Councilman, District 6; and

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Lafourche Parish Council
convened in regular session on , and does hereby accept and approve the
bid of Huey Stockstill, Inc. in the amount of $770,873.50 for the project entitled Farm to
Market Road (Raceland Sugars (Phases A and B), Gheens Shortcut Road (Phase A), and
Raceland Sr. Citizens Parking Lot), and authorizes the Parish President to sign, execute,
and administer said contract and all related documents.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that a certified copy of this Resolution shall be
forwarded to T. Baker Smith, Inc. (1100 South Acadia Road, Thibodaux, LA 70301);
Lafourche Parish Government Department of Public Works; Department of Finance, and
the Office of the Parish Administrator.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote, the vote thereon was as follows:


hardentl
ITEM 1


YEAS:
NAYS:
ABSENT:

And the resolution was declared adopted this day of

JERRY JONES, CHAIRMAN
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL

CARLEEN B. BABIN, COUNCIL CLERK
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL

E R S S i S i e

I, CARLEEN B. BABIN, Council Clerk for the Lafourche Parish Council, do hereby
certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of Resolution No.

adopted by the Assembled Council in Regular Session on
, at which meeting a quorum was present.

GIVEN UNDER MY OFFICIAL SIGNATURE AND SEAL OF OFFICE THIS ,
DAY OF , 2009.

CARLEEN B. BABIN, COUNCIL CLERK
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL
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T. BAKER SMITH, c.

PROFEGSIONAL CONSULTANTS SIKCE 19713

1100 South Acadia Road  Thibodaux, Louisiang 70301
Main Line: 985.4456. 7870 o Toli Free: 1.866.357.1050 = Fax: 9854489535 o Online: www.thsmith.corm

April 21, 2009

Ms. Charlotte A. Randolph
l.afourche Parish President
P. O. Drawer 5548
Thibodaux, LA 70302

Dear Ms. Randolph:

Re: 2008 CAPITAL PROJECT #08025
FARM TO MARKET ROAD PROJECT
Raceland Sugars (Phases A and B}
Gheens Shortcut Road (Phase A)
Raceland Sr. Citizens Parking Lot
ROAD SALES TAX DISTRICT 6

Bids were received earlier today Tuesday, April 21, 2009 at 11:00 am in the
first floor meeting room for the above referenced project. Enclosed please find an
overall bid tabulation and unit price bid comparison of the two bids received.

After review of the bids, we find them to be in order. The apparent low
bidder is Huey Stockstill, Inc. with a bid of $ 770,873.50. This bid is approximately
30% under our most current construction budget of $1,102,725.00 and contains
unit pricing for asphalt at near pre-Katrina levels. We therefore recommend that
Stockstill be awarded the project. Also enclosed are the original bid packages for
your files.

If you concur in our recommendation, please seek Parish Council approval,
and we will then forward the construction contract to Stockstill for execution.

Thank you for the opportunity to serve Lafourche Parish and if you have

any questions or require additional information please do not hesitate to contact
our office.

Sincerely yours,
T. BAKER SMITH, INC.

At

James P Ledet, P.E.
Principal |n Charge, Thibodaux Manager

081946T10.doc

PLANNING DESIGN CONSTRUCTION MANAGEMENT OPERATIONS COMPLIANCE
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OVERALL BID TABULATION
2008 CAPITAL PROJECT #08025
FARM TO MARKET ROAD PROJECT
Raceland Sugars (Phases A and B)
Gheens Shortcut Road (Phase A)
Raceland Sv. Citizen Parking Lot
Road Sales Tax District 6

OWNER: LAFOURCHE PARISH GOVERNMENT
BIDS RECEIVED April 21, 2009 ENGINEER: T. BAKER SMITH, INC.

1 |Huey Stockstill, Inc. - Lic.# 6487 J J Y J $770,873.50
2 |G&W Const.Co. Inc. - Lic# 10830 NO BID
3 [Phylway Const. LLC - Lic.# 27634 NO BID
4 |Barriere Const. Co. LLC - Lic.# 6276 J J J J $861,543.50
5 |Nationwide Const.Grp - Lic.# 43371 NO BID
6 |Coastal Bridge Commpany, LLC- Lic.# 481 NO BID

prepared by
T. Baker Smith, Inc.

081946BIDTAB1 .xis
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OWNER: LAFOURCHE PARISH GOVERNMENT

ENGINEER: T. BAKER SMITH, INC.
TBS Project No. 2008.1946
BIDS RECEIVED: April 21, 2009

UNIT PRICE BID COMPARISON
2008 CAPITAL PROJECT #08025
FARM TO MARKET ROAD PROJECT
Raceland Sugars (Phases A and B)
Gheens Shortcut Road (Phase A)
Raceland Sr. Citizens Parking Lot
Road SalesTax District 6

Hueyv Stockstill, 1nc. Barriere Construction Co.,L.L.C.

Item No. BASE BID ITEMS Qty. Unit Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
202-01 Removai of Structures & Obstructions | LS 5 0,000.00 § $ 6,000.00 (|3 15.000.00 1 S 15,000.00
203-05 Excavation and Embankment 1 LS S $.000.00 1 S 8,000.00 [Is 15000004 S 15,000.00
203-06 Excavation & Embankment {Ditch Sweeping) 335 LF $ 3008 1,005.00 || s 650§ 2,177.50
302-02 Class H Base Course 1,125 CY 3 7600 [ S $5.500.00 || s 65.00 4 § 73,1235.00
401-02 Agerecate Surface Course (Adj. Veh, Measure) 972 CY S 8500 S £5,536.00 | S 7500 % 72.906.00
5(2-01 Superpave Asphaltic Concrete 3,558 TON 5 7000 [ § 389,000.00 { s 7300 8 416,850.00
502-01-A  |Superpave Asphaitic Concrete (Drives & Turnouts) 526 TON 3 7000 S 36,820,004 s 7500 8 39.4503.00
509-01 Cold Planing Asphaltic Pavement 198 SY $ 3000 S 5,940.00 ) s 15004 8 2,970.00
510-01 Pavement Patching {Includes Base & Asphalf) 979 Y 3 6300 S 63,.635.00 4 5 000 5 39,160.00
701-14 Cleaning Existing Pipe 60 LF 5 20.00( S 1,200.00 §| $ 15.004 S GO0.00
706-01-A  |Concrete Walk (4" Thick) 47 SY 5 43.00 | S 2,021.00 4 5 10000 4| § 4,700.00
707-01 Congcrete Curb (6" Bamier) 235 LF 5 2400 § 3,640.00 § S 75001 8 17,625.00
713-01 Temporary Signs and Bamcades | LS $ 600000 | S 6,000.00 '3 2000000 S 20,000.00
727-01% Mobilization 1 LS S 22.000.00 i § 22,000.00 is $2.300.00 8 5 82,500.00
737-03 Painted Traffic Striping 51l LLF 3 1304 S 766.50 | S LOGH S 311.00
740-01 Construction Layout i LS $ £.000.00 [ S 6,000.00 |13 20000061 S 20,000.60
3-001 Parking 1ot Pavement 823 SY S s100f S 4207500 | s 40004 $ 33,000.00
$-002 Parkine Lot Drainage i LS $ 3.00000 | $ 3,000.00 (s 5000008 S 5,000,060
$-003 Parking Bumpers 9 EA 5 75004 8 675.00 | 3 75004 8 675.00
TOTAL BIDITEMS 3 770,873.50 8 861,543.50

2008, 1836 BIDCOMP ARISON.x1s

Jamci:‘P. Ledet, P.E.
T. BAK£R SMITH, INC.
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On motion by , seconded by , the following resolution
was introduced and adopted;

RESOLUTION NO.

A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING THE LOW BID FROM HUEY
STOCKSTILL, INC. IN THE AMOUNT OF $1,443,574.60 FOR THE
PROJECT ENTITLED ROADWAY  AND DRAINAGE
IMPROVEMENTS IN ROAD SALES TAX DISTRICT NO. 2-
PHASE 4E AND AUTHORIZING THE PARISH PRESIDENT TO
SIGN, EXECUTE, AND ADMINISTER SAID CONTRACT AND
ASSOCIATED DOCUMENTS.

WHEREAS, the Engineer for this project, Picciola & Associates, Inc. legally
advertised the project in the official journal; and

WHEREAS, the bids were received and read publicly on April 21, 2009 as
follows:
Barriere Construction Co. LLC $1,743,197.95
Huey Stockstill, Inc. $1,443,574.60

WHEREAS, the low bidder is Huey Stockstill, Inc. in the amount of
$1,443,574.60; and

WHEREAS, it is the recommendation of Picciola & Associates, Inc.
and the Administration of Lafourche Parish Government that the low bid of
Huey Stockstill, Inc. be accepted; and

WHEREAS, this resolution was sponsored for Administration by Mr. Daniel
Lorraine, Councilman, District 9; and

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Lafourche Parish Council
convened in regular session on , and does hereby accept and approve the
bid of Huey Stockstill, Inc. in the amount of $1,443,574.60 for the project entitled
Roadway and Drainage Improvements in Road Sales Tax District No. 2- Phase 4E, and
authorizes the Parish President to sign, execute, and administer said contract and all
related documents.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that a certified copy of this Resolution shall be
forwarded to Picciola & Associates, Inc. (P.O. Box 687, Cut Off, LA 70345); Lafourche
Parish Government Department of Public Works; Department of Finance, and the Office
of the Parish Administrator.

This resolution having been submitted to a vote, the vote thereon was as follows:

YEAS:
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NAYS:
ABSENT:

And the resolution was declared adopted this day of

JERRY JONES, CHAIRMAN
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL

CARLEEN B. BABIN, COUNCIL CLERK
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL

EE R S S S S

I, CARLEEN B. BABIN, Council Clerk for the Lafourche Parish Council, do hereby
certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of Resolution No.

adopted by the Assembled Council in Regular Session on
, at which meeting a quorum was present.

GIVEN UNDER MY OFFICIAL SIGNATURE AND SEAL OF OFFICE THIS ,
DAY OF , 2009.

CARLEEN B. BABIN, COUNCIL CLERK
LAFOURCHE PARISH COUNCIL
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BID TABULATION

PROJECT NAME: Roadway and Drainage Improvements
In Road Sales Tax District No. 2 - Phase 4E
OWNER: Lafourche Parish Government
ENGINEER: Picciola & Associates, Inc.
DATE: April 21,2009 10:00 A.M.
STATE TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
CONTRACTOR LICENSE NO. BASE BID ALTERNATE 1 | ALTERNATE 2 | ALTERNATE 3 TOTAL BID
1 {Huey Stockstill, Inc. 6487 $1,081,186.10 $103,527.60 $111,974.20 $146,886.70 $1,443,574.60
2 |Barriere Construction Co., Inc. 6276 $1,318,393.95 $120,079.00 $119,071.00 $185,654.00 $1,743,197.95
3 |Byron E. Talbot Contractor, Inc. 12198 NO BID
4 |Sealevel Construction, Inc. 33678 NO BID
5 [Phylway Construction, L.L.C. 27634 NO BID
6 |G&W Construction Co., Inc. 10830 NO BID
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CONTRACT: Lafourche Parish Government Engineer: Picciola & Associates, Inc.
Roadway and Drainage Improvements Bid Date: April 21, 2009
In Road Sales Tax District No. 2 - Phase 4E

Bidder No. 1 Bidder No. 2
Huey Stockstill, Inc. Barriere Construction Co., L.L.C.
LA Cont. Lisc. No. 6487 LA Cont. Lisc. No. 6276
Item No. Pay Item Quantity Unit Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount
BASE BID
202-02-D  |Removal of Concrete Walks and Drives 16 Square Yard | $ 28.00  § 448.00 | $ - 55001% 880.00
202-02-1  |Removal of Existing Culverts 673 Linear Foot | $ 10.00 | $ 6,730.00 | $ 6.001$ 4,038.00
202-02-J  |Removal of Existing Catch Basins 22 Each $ 200.00 | $ 4,400.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 2,750.00
203-01 General Excavation 1,545 Cubic Yard | § 11.00 | $ 16,995.00 | $ 25.00 | % 38,625.00
302-01 Class II Base Coutse 2,060 Ton $ 4500 | $ 92,700.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 92,700.00
303-01-B  |In-Place Cement Stabilized Base Course (8" Thick) 6,567 Square Yard | § 630 9% 41,372.10 | $ 9.00 | $ 59,103.00
303-01-C  [In-Place Cement Stabilized Base Course (10" Thick) 6,483 Square Yard | $ 7.00|$ 45,381.00 | $ 10.00 { $ 64,830.00
401-03 Aggregate Surface Course 569 Ton $ 37.00| $ 21,053.001 $ 60.00 | $ 34,140.00
501-01-A  |Asphaltic Concrete (Paved Drives and Turnouts) 331 Ton $ 130.00 | § 43,030.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 49,650.00
501-01-C  |Asphaltic Concrete Binder Course (Type 3) 2,667 Ton $ 72.00 | $ 192,024.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 200,025.00
501-01-D  |Asphaltic Concrete Wearing Course (Type 3) 1,389 Ton $ 72001 $ 100,008.00 | $ 85001 $ 118,065.00
509-01-A  {Cold Planing Asphaltic Pavement (2") 5,861 Square Yard | $ 5001$ 29,305.00 | $ 200 (% 11,722.00
509-01-C  [Cold Planing Asphaltic Pavement (Tie-Ins) 9 Each $ 800.00 | $ 7,200.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 900.00
701-02-B  [Cross Drain Pipe Arch (21"x15" B.C.C.S.P.A.) 323 Linear Foot | § 65.00 1% 20,995.00 | $ 64.50 | $ 20,833.50
701-02-D  |Cross Drain Pipe Arch (28"x20" B.C.C.S.P.A.) 128 Linear Foot $ 83.00 |3 10,624.00 | $ 80.50 | $ 10,304.00
701-02-E  |Cross Drain Pipe Arch (35"x24" B.C.C.S.P.A.) 156 Linear Foot | $ 85.00 | $ 13,260.00 | $ 81501 8% 12,714.00
701-02-F  |Cross Drain Pipe Arch (42"x29" B.C.C.S.P.A.) 38 Linear Foot | $ 90.00 | $ 3,420.00 | $ 8750 (% 3,325.00
701-06-A  [Side Drain Pipe Arch (17"x13" B.C.C.S.P.A.) 125 Linear Foot | $§ 32.00|$% 4,000.00 [ $ 3200 $% 4,000.00
701-06-B  |Side Drain Pipe Arch (21"x15" B.C.C.S.P.A.) 704 Linear Foot $ 340013 23,936.00 | $ 3350 $ 23,584.00
701-06-D  |Side Drain Pipe Arch (28"x20" B.C.C.S.P.A.) 788 Linear Foot | § 38.00 | $ 29,944.00 | $ 3750 | $ 29,550.00
701-06-E  1Side Drain Pipe Arch (35"x24" B.C.C.S.P.A.) 20 Linear Foot | $ 65.00}$ 1,300.00 | $ 62501 $ 1,250.00
701-06-F  |Side Drain Pipe Arch (42"x29" B.C.C.S.P.A) 438 Linear Foot $ 61.00$ 26,718.00 | § 5850 $ 25,623.00
701-06-H  |Side Drain Pipe Arch (57"x38" B.C.C.S.P.A.) 10 Linear Foot | $ 135.00 | $ 1,350.00 | $ 13050 | § 1,305.00
701-15 Concrete Collar 7 Each $ 420.00 | $ 2,940.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 2,800.00
702-03-A  |Catch Basin (CB-01) 49 Each $ 2,000.00 | $ 98,000.00 | $ 1,700.00 | $ $3,300.00
702-03-B  {Catch Basin (CB-02) 12 Each $ 2,300.00 | $ 27,600.00 | $ 2,300.00 | $ 27,600.00
702-03-1 [Catch Basin (CB-4'x4") 2 Each $ 2,400.00 | $ 4,800.00 ] $ 2,300.00 | $ 4,600.00
702-03-J  |Catch Basin (CB-5'x7") 1 Each $ 4,500.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 4,400.00 | $ 4,400.00
702-03-K  |Catch Basin (CB-6'x6") 1 Each $ 4,800.00 | $ 4,800.00 | $ 4,800.00 | § 4,800.00
702-03-1.  |Catch Basin (CB-7'x8") 1 Each $ 6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 5,900.00 | $ 5,900.00
702-04-A | Adjusting Manholes 2 Each $ 500.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 210.00
702-04-D  |Adjusting Water/Gas Valve Cover 4 Each $ 200.00 | $ 800.00 { $ 3800 8% 152.00
706-02-C  |Concrete Drive (6"Thick) 26 Square Yard | § 150.00 | $ 3,900.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 3,640.00
711-03-C  |Riprap (301b) 85 Ton $ 100.00 | $ 8,500.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 8,075.00



hardentl
ITEM 2


CONTRACT: Lafourche Parish Government Engineer: Picciola & Associates, Inc.
Roadway and Drainage Improvements Bid Date: April 21, 2009
In Road Sales Tax District No. 2 - Phase 4E

Bidder No. 1 Bidder No. 2
Huey Stockstill, Inc. Barriere Construction Co., L.L.C.
LA Cont. Lisc. No. 6487 LA Cont. Lisc. No. 6276
Item No. Pay Item Quantity Unit Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount
713-01 Temporary Signs and Barricades I Lump Sum $ 8,000.00 ] $ 8,000.00 | $ 88,900.00 | $ 88,900.00
715-01 Topsoil 3,746 Cubic Yard $ 13001 $ 48,698.00 | $ 140018 52,444.00
723-02 Granular Material (Vehicular Measurement) 195 Cubic Yard | $ 18.00 | § 3,510.00 | $ 19.00 | $ 3,705.00
726-01 Bedding Material (Limestone or Recycled Portland Cement Concrete) 719 Ton $ 3500 $ 25,165.00 | $ 36.001% 25,884.00
727-01 Mobilization 1 LumpSum |$ 60,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 130,000.00 | $ 130,000.00
740-01 Construction Layout 1 Lump Sum $ 14,000.00 | § 14,000.00 { § 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00
S-001 Saw Cut Concrete Walks and Drives 66 Linear Foot | $ 6.00($% 396.00 | $ 5501$ 363.00
S-002 Saw Cut Asphalt Roadway 85 Linear Foot | $ 10.00 | § 850.00 | $ 11.50 | $ 977.50
S-003 Geotextile Fabric (Class D) 3,089 Square Yard | $ 2001(% 6,178.00 | $ 070 | $ 2,162.30
S-004 Geogrid 3,089 Square Yard | $ 4001 $ 12,356.00 | § 1851 8% 5,714.65
S-005 Ditch Digging) 300 Linear Foot | $ 10.001$ 3,000.00 1 $ 950 |$ 2,850.00
BASE BID TOTAL § 1,081,186.10 $ 1,318,393.95
Bidder No. 1 Bidder No. 2
Huey Stockstill, Inc. Barriere Construction Co., L.L.C.
LA Cont. Lisc. No. 6487 LA Cont. Lisc. No. 6276
Item No. Pay ltem Quantity Unit Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount
ALTERNATE 1
202-02-1 |Removal of Existing Culverts 22 Linear Foot | $ 10.00 | $ 220.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 132.00
202-02-]  [Removal of Existing Catch Basins 2 Each $ 200.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 250.00
303-01-B  {In-Place Cement Stabilized Base Course (8" Thick) 2,312 Square Yard | § 630 (8% 14,565.60 | $ 9.001{$% 20,808.00
401-03 Aggregate Surface Course 120 Ton $ 37.00 | $ 4,440.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 7,200.00
501-01-A  |Asphaltic Concrete (Paved Drives and Turnouts) 110 Ton $ 130.00 | $ 14,300.00 | $ 15000 | $ 16,500.00
501-01-C  [Asphaltic Concrete Binder Course (Type 3) 323 Ton $ 72,00 | $ 23,256.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 24,225.00
501-01-D  |Asphaitic Concrete Wearing Course (Type 3) 194 Ton $ 7200 $ 13,968.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 16,490.00
509-01-A  |Cold Planing Asphaltic Pavement (2") 2,040 Square Yard | § 50018% 10,200.00 | $ 200($% 4,080.00
701-02-B  {Cross Drain Pipe Arch (21"x15" B.C.C.S.P.A.) 22 Linear Foot $ 64.00 [ $ 1,408.00 | $ 64.50 [ $ 1,419.00
702-03-A  |Catch Basin (CB-01) 2 Each $ 2,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 1,700.00 | $ 3,400.00
702-04-B  |Adjusting Catch Basins 9 Each $ 600.00 | $ 5,400.00 | § 555.00 | $ 4,995.00
702-04-D  |Adjusting Water/Gas Valve Cover 2 Each $ 20000 | $ 400.00 | $ 3800193 76.00
713-01 Temporary Signs and Batricades ] Lump Sum $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00
715-01 Topsoil 10 CubicYard |$ 13.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 14001 $ 140.00
726-01 Bedding Material (Limestone or Recycled Portland Cement Concrete) 24 Ton $ 3500 | $ 840.00 | $ 36.00 | $ 864.00
727-01 Mobilization 1 Lump Sum $ 7,000.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 12,500.00 | $ 12,500.00
740-01 Construction Layout 1 Lump Sum $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00
ALTERNATE 1 TOTAL § 103,527.60 $ 120,079.00
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CONTRACT: Lafourche Parish Government Engineer: Picciola & Associates, Inc.
Roadway and Drainage Improvements Bid Date: April 21, 2009
In Road Sales Tax District No. 2 - Phase 4E
Bidder No. 1 Bidder No. 2
Huey Stockstill, Inc. Barriere Construction Co., L.L.C.
LA Cont. Lisc. No. 6487 LA Cont. Lisc. No. 6276
Item No. Pay Item Quantity Unit Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount
ALTERNATE 2
202-02-1 {Removal of Existing Culverts 138 Linear Foot | § 10.00 ¢ § 1,380.00 | $ 6.001§ 828.00
202-02-J]  |Removal of Existing Catch Basins 7 Each $ 200.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 875.00
303-01-B  |In-Place Cement Stabilized Base Course (8" Thick) 1,724 Square Yard | § 630 $ 10,861.20 1 § 9.00|$ 15,516.00
401-03 Aggregate Surface Course 92 Ton $ 37.00 | $ 3,404.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 5,520.00
501-01-A  JAsphaltic Concrete (Paved Drives and Turnouts) 64 Ton $ 130.00 | $ 8,320.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 9,600.00
501-01-C  [Asphaltic Concrete Binder Course (Type 3) 241 Ton $ 72001 % 17,352.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 18,075.00
501-01-D  |Asphaltic Concrete Wearing Course (Type 3) 144 Ton $ 72.00 | $ 10,368.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 12,240.00
509-01-A  |Cold Planing Asphaltic Pavement (2") 1,521 Square Yard | § 5001(8% 7,605.00 | $ 200 (% 3,042.00
509-01-C  |Cold Planing Asphaltic Pavement (Tie-Ins) 4 Each $ 800.00 | $ 3,20000 1 $ 100.00 | $ 400.00
701-02-B  [Cross Drain Pipe Arch (21"x15" B.C.C.S.P.A.) 110 Linear Foot $ 65.00 | $ 7,150.00 | $ 6450 { $ 7,095.00
701-02-D  |Cross Drain Pipe Arch (28"x20" B.C.C.S.P.A.) 28 Linear Foot | $ 68.00 | $ 1,904.00 | $ 80.50 | $ 2,254.00
702-03-A  |Catch Basin (CB-01) 10 Each $ 2,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 1,700.00 | $ 17,000.00
702-04-D  |Adjusting Water/Gas Valve Cover 1 Each $ 200.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 3800 % 38.00
713-01 Temporary Signs and Barricades 1 Lump Sum | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | § 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00
715-01 Topsoil 100 Cubic Yard | § 13.00 | § 1,300.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 1,400.00
726-01 Bedding Material (Limestone or Recycled Portland Cement Concrete) 158 Ton $ 3500 | $ 5,530.00 | $ 36.00]$ 5,688.00
727-01 Mobilization 1 Lump Sum | $ 8,000.00 | § 8,000.00 | § 12,500.00 | § 12,500.00
740-01 Construction Layout 1 Lump Sum $ 3,000.00 1 $ 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00
ALTERNATE 2 TOTAL § 111,974.20 $ 119,071.00
Bidder No. 1 Bidder No. 2
Huey Stockstill, Inc. Barriere Construction Co., L.L.C.
LA Cont. Lisc. No. 6487 LA Cont. Lisc. No. 6276
Item No. Pay Item Quantity Unit Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount
ALTERNATE 3
202-02-1 {Removal of Existing Culverts 48 Linear Foot | $ 10.00 | § 480.00 | $ 6.00 % 288.00
202-02-]  [Removal of Existing Catch Basins 3 Each $ 20000 | $ 600.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 375.00
303-01-B  {In-Place Cement Stabilized Base Course (8" Thick) 3,029 Square Yard | § 630 (8% 19,082.70 { $ 9.00 1% 27,261.00
303-02 Removal of Existing Patches 50 Square Yard | § 30.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 3,000.00
401-03 Aggregate Surface Course 172 Ton $ 37.00 | $ 6,364.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 10,320.00
501-01-A  }Asphaitic Concrete (Paved Drives and Turnouts) 245 Ton $ 100.00 | $ 24,500.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 36,750.00
501-01-C  |Asphaltic Concrete Binder Course (Type 3) 419 Ton $ 72001 % 30,168.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 31,425.00
501-01-D  jAsphaltic Concrete Wearing Course (Type 3) 251 Ton $ 7200 $ 18,072.00 | $ 8500193 21,335.00
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CONTRACT: Lafourche Parish Government Engineer: Picciola & Associates, Inc.
Roadway and Drainage Improvements Bid Date: April 21, 2009
In Road Sales Tax District No. 2 - Phase 4E
Bidder No. 1 Bidder No. 2
Huey Stockstill, Inc. Barriere Construction Co., L.L.C.
LA Cont. Lisc. No. 6487 LA Cont. Lisc. No. 6276
Item No. Pay Item Quantity Unit Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount
509-01-A  [Cold Planing Asphaltic Pavement (2") 2,651 Square Yard | $ 500(% 13,255.00 | § 200 (9% 5,302.00
510-01-D  [Pavement Patching (9" Minimum Thickness) (Finish Patch) 10 Ton $ 35000 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 300.00 1 $ 3,000.00
701-02-A  |Cross Drain Pipe Arch (17"x13" B.C.C.S.P.A.) 50 Linear Foot | $ 65.00 | $ 3,250.00 | $ 63.001 8% 3,150.00
702-03-A  |Catch Basin (CB-01) 4 Each $ 2,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 1,700.00 | $ 6,800.00
702-04-D  {Adjusting Water/Gas Valve Cover 1 Each $ 20000 | $ 200.00 | $ 38.00($ 38.00
713-01 Temporary Signs and Barricades 1 Lump Sum | $ 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
715-01 Topsoil 30 Cubic Yard | $ 13.00 | § 390.00 | $ 1400 $ 420.00
726-01 Bedding Material (Limestone or Recycled Portland Cement Concrete) 115 Ton $ 35.00 [ $ 4,025.00 | $ 3600 $ 4,140.00
727-01 Mobilization 1 Lump Sum | § 8,000.00 1 § 8,000.00 | $ 17,500.00 | $ 17,500.00
740-01 Construction Layout 1 Lump Sum $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00
S-002 Saw Cut Asphalt Roadway 50 Linear Foot | $ 10.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 550.00
ALTERNATE 3 TOTAL § 146,886.70 $ 185,654.00
TOTALBID § 1,443,574.60 $ 1,743,197.95

CERTIFIED BY: M

Jbseph C. Pigfiola, 1L, P.¥. 4
DATE: m /0%
v, y *
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